
Isolate at home for at 
least 5 days.

Talk to your doctor and 
monitor your symptoms.

Notify your close contacts 
to stop the spread.

Wear a well-fitting mask 
around others at home.

Before ending isolation: 
get a follow-up lab test; 
consult with your doctor 
if you were severely ill or 
have a weakened immune 
system.

Chances are, you’re 
negative. Go back to 
normal activities.

Monitor for developing 
symptoms and retest if 
necessary.

Get vaccinated to 
protect yourself and 
others from serious illness, 
hospitalization, and death.

Unless in isolation, wear 
a mask around others in 
public spaces.

*You are up to date after getting all the COVID-19 vaccines and boosters recommended for you. TakeCareTexas.org

If you’re not vaccinated, 
talk to your doctor about 
when to get vaccinated 
after recovering from 
COVID-19.

That’s great!

For more protection, wear 
a mask around others in 
public spaces.

It could be a false 
negative. Get a lab test 
or take another home test 
24-36 hours later.

Wear a well-fitting mask 
around others, at home 
and in public.
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https://www.cdc.gov/coronavirus/2019-ncov/vaccines/stay-up-to-date.html
http://TakeCareTexas.org

